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3.5.1 Definition and Management Intent 
“Bycatch” for the purposes of this fishery management plan is defined as fish caught in an ocean 
salmon fishery which are not sold or kept for personal use and includes economic discards, 
regulatory discards, and fishery mortality due to an encounter with fishing gear that does not result 
in capture of fish.  Bycatch does not include any fish that legally are retained in a fishery and kept 
for personal, tribal, or cultural use, or that enter commerce through sale, barter, or trade.  In 
addition, under the provisions of the MSA, bycatch does not include salmon released alive under 
a recreational catch-and-release fishery management program. 

Under the salmon FMP, the primary bycatch that occurs is bycatch of salmon species.  Therefore, 
the Council’s conservation and management measures shall seek to minimize salmon bycatch and 
bycatch mortality (drop off and hooking mortality) to the greatest extent practical in all ocean 
fisheries.  When bycatch cannot be avoided, priority will be given to conservation and management 
measures that seek to minimize bycatch mortality and ensure the extended survival of such fish.  
These measures will be developed in consideration of the biological and ecological impacts to the 
affected species, the social and economic impacts to the fishing industry and associated 
communities, and the impacts upon the fishing, management, and enforcement practices currently 
employed in ocean salmon fisheries (see also Section 6.5.3). 

Shared EC Species, identified in Table 1-4, could continue to be taken incidentally without violating 
Federal regulations, unless regulated or restricted for other purposes, such as with bycatch 
minimization regulations. The targeting of Shared EC Species is prohibited. 

3.5.2 Occurrence 
The present bycatch and bycatch mortality estimates and methodologies for salmon in salmon 
fisheries are documented by the STT annually in the SAFE and Preseason Report III documents.  
Bycatch of salmon in Pacific Coast trawl fisheries is documented in Amendment 12 (PFMC 
1997a).  More recent information is reported in a Section 7 biological opinion regarding salmon 
bycatch in the groundfish fishery (NMFS 2006), and a subsequent report that summarizes the 
bycatch of salmon in recent years (Bellman et al. 2011).  Salmon fisheries or fishery practices that 
lack or do not have recent observation data or estimates of bycatch composition and associated 
mortality rates will be identified by the Council for future research priority in their biannual 
Research and Data Needs Report to NMFS.  Future changes in the procedures and methodologies 
will occur only if a comprehensive technical review of existing biological data justifies a 
modification and is approved by the STT, SSC, and Council.  All of these changes will occur 
within the schedule established for Salmon Methodology Review and apart from the preseason 
planning process (PFMC 2008). 

Bycatch of fish other than salmon in salmon fisheries is generally very limited.  Only hook-and-
line gear is allowed in ocean salmon fisheries and regulations allow for retention of most 
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groundfish species and limited numbers of Pacific halibut that are caught incidentally while salmon 
fishing. 

3.5.3 Standard Reporting Methodology 
Within the salmon preseason planning process, management alternatives will be assessed for the 
effects on the amount and type of salmon bycatch and bycatch mortality.  Estimates of salmon 
bycatch and incidental mortalities associated with salmon fisheries will be included in the 
modeling assessment of total fishery impact and assigned to the stock or stock complex projected 
to be impacted by the proposed management measures.  The resultant fishery impact assessment 
reports for the ocean salmon fisheries will specify the amount of salmon bycatch and bycatch 
mortality associated with each accompanying management alternative.  The final analysis of 
Council-adopted management measures will contain an assessment of the total salmon bycatch 
and bycatch mortality for ocean salmon fisheries, and include the percentage that these estimates 
represent compared to the total harvest projected for each species, as well as the relative change 
from the previous year’s total bycatch and bycatch mortality levels. 
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