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March	
  19,	
  2014	
  
	
  
Ms.	
  Dorothy	
  Lowman,	
  Chair	
  
and	
  Council	
  Members	
  
Pacific	
  Fishery	
  Management	
  Council	
  
7700	
  NE	
  Ambassador	
  Place,	
  Suite	
  101	
  
Portland,	
  OR	
  97220	
  
	
  
RE:	
  	
  April	
  2014	
  Briefing	
  Book	
  Public	
  Comment	
  -­‐-­‐	
  March	
  2014	
  Decision	
  Document	
  -­‐	
  Highly	
  Migratory	
  
Species	
  -­‐	
  Drift	
  Gillnet	
  Monitoring,	
  Management	
  and	
  Alternative	
  Gear	
  Report	
  	
  
	
  
Dear	
  Chair	
  Lowman	
  and	
  Council	
  Members,	
  
	
  
Please	
  accept	
  these	
  public	
  comments	
  from	
  Turtle	
  Island	
  Restoration	
  Network	
  (TIRN)	
  on	
  the	
  decisions	
  
made	
  at	
  the	
  March	
  2014	
  Pacific	
  Fishery	
  Management	
  Council	
  meeting	
  related	
  to	
  Driftnet	
  Gillnet	
  
Monitoring,	
  Management	
  and	
  Alternative	
  Gear	
  Report.	
  We	
  hope	
  that	
  you	
  will	
  consider	
  these	
  views	
  as	
  
you	
  move	
  forward	
  on	
  the	
  "actions	
  toward	
  a	
  goal	
  of	
  developing	
  a	
  comprehensive	
  plan	
  to	
  transition	
  the	
  
current	
  drift	
  gillnet	
  fishery	
  to	
  a	
  fishery	
  utilizing	
  a	
  suite	
  of	
  more	
  environmentally	
  and	
  economically	
  
sustainable	
  gear	
  types"	
  that	
  are	
  identified	
  in	
  the	
  meeting's	
  Decision	
  Document.	
  
	
  
First,	
  TIRN	
  thanks	
  the	
  Council	
  for	
  making	
  the	
  decision	
  to	
  take	
  action	
  to	
  transition	
  the	
  driftnet	
  gillnet	
  
fishery	
  to	
  more	
  sustainable	
  gear	
  types.	
  The	
  Council	
  based	
  its	
  decision	
  on	
  high	
  quality,	
  comprehensive	
  
data	
  presented	
  by	
  the	
  HMS	
  Team,	
  fishery	
  researchers	
  and	
  the	
  conservation	
  community.	
  TIRN	
  applauds	
  
the	
  Council's	
  leadership	
  on	
  moving	
  the	
  swordfish	
  fishery	
  to	
  more	
  sustainable	
  gear	
  and	
  the	
  well-­‐
informed	
  deliberations	
  that	
  led	
  to	
  the	
  decision.	
  
	
  
The	
  Council	
  also	
  made	
  a	
  strong	
  decision	
  not	
  to	
  expand	
  the	
  driftnet	
  fishery	
  into	
  the	
  Pacific	
  Leatherback	
  
Conservation	
  Area.	
  TIRN	
  thanks	
  the	
  Council	
  for	
  ending	
  further	
  action	
  on	
  such	
  proposals	
  after	
  two	
  years	
  
of	
  fact	
  finding	
  and	
  scrutiny.	
  
	
  
TIRN	
  strongly	
  supports	
  the	
  transition	
  of	
  the	
  driftnet	
  gear	
  on	
  behalf	
  of	
  our	
  more	
  than	
  65,000	
  members	
  
and	
  supporters.	
  TIRN	
  is	
  also	
  confident	
  that	
  we	
  can	
  continue	
  to	
  generate	
  wide	
  public	
  support	
  for	
  
Council	
  action	
  to	
  remove	
  driftnets	
  from	
  the	
  California	
  coast.	
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As	
  the	
  Council	
  moves	
  forward,	
  TIRN	
  hopes	
  that	
  you	
  will	
  consider	
  these	
  additional	
  views	
  on	
  the	
  action	
  
items	
  spelled	
  out	
  in	
  the	
  Decision	
  Document,	
  in	
  order,	
  as	
  follows:	
  
	
  
1. Sending a letter to NMFS requesting reinstatement of the emergency rule that lapsed on January 31 
and implementation of the Pacific Offshore Cetacean Take Reduction Team recommendations so there 
is no gap in application while NMFS implements permanent regulations on this matter.  
	
  
TIRN	
  wholeheartedly	
  supports	
  this	
  strong	
  conservation	
  action	
  to	
  protect	
  endangered	
  sperm	
  whales.	
  
We	
  also	
  urge	
  the	
  Council	
  to	
  comment	
  on	
  the	
  permanent	
  regulations	
  when	
  they	
  are	
  published	
  to	
  urge	
  
that	
  they	
  are	
  at	
  least	
  as	
  protective	
  as	
  the	
  emergency	
  regulations.	
  
	
  
2. Requesting NMFS provide a report at the June Council meeting on issues and possible solutions to 
more comprehensively placing a transitioning swordfish fishery under MSA authority, including Federal 
permit options that would replace the current California State permit regime. 
 
The Council can move forward with actions to transition the driftnet gear without removing the state's 
authority over fishery permits. There is no clear need for this action from a conservation or fishery 
management perspective.  
 
TIRN is seriously concerned with the proposal to replace the current California state permit regime with 
an exclusively federal system because it would limit or remove the state's authority to set conditions on 
the permits as needed to protect the state's natural resources. The fishery has been managed as a joint 
state-federal fishery since 2004. Other states including Washington and Oregon continue to manage 
driftnet and other gear types and fisheries successfully.  Why remove California's authority? 
 
The state of California and the Legislature have been an asset to management of the fishery over the 
decades with requirements for time and area closures, gear changes and limiting effort through permit 
conditions. The state has also acted as a "backstop" to various federal fishery initiatives that have 
conflicted with longstanding state policies and statutes, such as those that limit the use of driftnets and 
other high bycatch gear including pelagic longlining. 
 
The Council can better move forward to transition the driftnet fishery in collaboration with the state of 
California than by removing its authority over permits. TIRN urges the Council not to move forward on 
federalization the fishery permits for the following reasons: 
 
1. The Council can move forward with actions to transition the driftnet fishery without removing the 
state's authority over fishery permits. There is no need to take this action. 
 
2. Currently the state regulates the driftnet fishery as a limited access fishery, dating back several 
decades. The federal permitting scheme is open access without any limits on the permits, and could 
open the door to increased driftnet effort and other unintended consequences. 
 
3. The state of California has imposed numerous conditions on the fishery over the decades through 
legislation and voter initiatives to protect the state's fisheries and natural resources from the wasteful 
nature of the driftnet gear. While these regulations were incorporated into the federal FMP, the 
federalization of the fishery could open the door to revising or weakening these regulations without the 
direct input or oversight of the people of California, including its elected officials. 
 
4. The history of the driftnet fishery shows that National Marine Fisheries Service has acted in conflict 
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with the policies and interests of the state of California in the past. For example, NMFS has proposed 
EFPs to expand the driftnet fishery and to introduce pelagic longlining along the coast in direct conflict 
with longstanding California state policies. Even at the end of the Council deliberations on the driftnet 
fishery in March, the NMFS delegate suggested removing the shallow-set longline ban in the U.S. West 
Coast EEZ that was excluded from the 2004 FMP due to take of endangered sea turtles. These efforts 
are counterproductive to sustainable fisheries and the interests of the state of California. 
 
The state Legislature and state agencies including the California Coastal Commission and the Ocean 
Protection Council have acted to oppose federal driftnet and longline fishery initiatives, which were 
ultimately defeated. Removing the state's permitting authority could needlessly weaken or remove the 
authority of these important conservation entities. Instead, the Council can benefit from the expertise 
and support of the state of California in pursuing its actions without removing the state's permitting 
authority. 
 
3. Tasking Council staff with noticing the public that the Council would consider preliminary 
experimental fishing permit (EFP) approval on fishery transition proposals at the June 2014 Council 
meeting, and encouraging EFP submission. Further, the Council directed the Highly Migratory Species 
Management Team (HMSMT) to prepare research protocols to guide the evaluation of EFPs to test 
alternative gear types.  
 
TIRN supports consideration for EFPs for alternative gears such as buoy gear and harpooning. TIRN 
also supports the development of research protocols to guide evaluation of EFPs.  
 
However, TIRN and our allies will vigorously oppose EFPs for pelagic longlining along the U.S. West 
Coast EEZ as it is prohibited due to take of endangered sea turtle species. No changes in the status or 
populations of endangered species nor in the type or nature of the longlining warrant any further testing 
or research. 
 
The recent deep-set daytime longline research conducted by NMFS in the PLCA over the past three 
years only reinforces the high bycatch nature of the gear. It is not a sustainable alternative to driftnets. 
 
The Hawaii longline fisheries, both deep set and shallow set, continue to take endangered species 
including false killer whales, endangered sea turtles and endangered bird species at levels that have 
triggered closures. NMFS has increased the allowable takes of sea turtles in the Hawaii shallow-set 
longline fishery despite the species' continued decline, prompting ongoing litigation from 
conservationists. New protective measures were required this year in the Hawaii deepset longline tuna 
fishery due to take of endangered false killer whales. A new Biological Opinion is coming out that may 
require additional protections. These are problematic, high maintenance, unsustainable fisheries - not 
models for California. 
 
4. Tasking Council staff, the HMSAS, and the HMSMT with initial development of a fishery transition 
plan and possible regulations under a typical MSA process, with the transition period being of sufficient 
duration to maintain a reasonable commercial flow of swordfish to domestic markets during the 
transition. The initial compilation of ideas was scheduled for the June 2014 Council meeting, with 
typical MSA process management tools to use such things as, seasons, areas, allowable gear 
alternatives, and integration of EFP results.  
 
TIRN supports development of a fishery transition plan to end to the use of driftnet gear. TIRN supports 
programs to help the fishermen transition to other gears or enterprises. 
 
The Council needs to define "maintain a reasonable commercial flow of swordfish to domestic 
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markets." What does this mean? When considering the economics of the swordfish fishery, the Council 
should seek clarification on this question. The Council should also ask for analysis of the economic and 
conservation benefits of a lower production, high value swordfish fishery caught with sustainable gears.  
 
As part of the swordfish transition, the Council should consider partnering with the California 
Sustainable Seafood Initiative to promote sustainable swordfish and encourage Californians to avoid 
swordfish imports at least until they are required to meet U.S. standards. 
	
  
Thanks	
  again	
  for	
  your	
  actions	
  and	
  consideration.	
  

Sincerely	
  yours,	
  

	
  

	
  
	
  

Teri	
  Shore	
  
Program	
  Director	
  
415	
  663	
  8590	
  ext.	
  108	
  
	
  

	
  

 



Agenda Item E.1 
Supplemental Open Comment 2 (3 Letters) 

April 2014









































KZO SEA FARMS

Agenda Item E.1
Supplemental Open Comment 3

April 2014





Independent research institutions, specializing in marine science and 
spatial planning, will develop scientific data for evaluating the 
environmental and social impacts of offshore shellfish mariculture. 

These institutions include: The Wrigley Institute for Environmental 
Studies, Scripps Institution for Oceanography, National Ocean Tracking 
Network, NOAA’s Integrated Ocean Observing System, NOAA’s National 
Marine Fisheries Center, and Southwest Fisheries Science Center.

Lockheed Martin will provide remote sensing data and technical 
oversight. Verizon will provide system integration and cloud connectivity 
for independent and transparent scientific analysis.

OFFSHORE MARICULTURE MONITORING PROGRAM



CAPTAIN JACK RESEARCH VESSEL
DEDICATED TO THE MONITORING PROGRAM



Adopted Mitigation and 
Monitoring Plan

• Monthly monitoring of ropes, cables and equipment to avoid 
marine mammal entanglement and repair or replace broken ropes 
and material

• Monitoring program of sediments, benthic communities, fish 
populations, marine mammal populations, species diversity, and 
production of eggs and larvae from cultivated non-native species.  
This will include both control plots and project locations for an 
accurate comparison.

• A Lost/Damaged Fishing Gear Compensation Plan to compensate 
the fishing industry for any lost or damaged gear that becomes 
entangled with project structures.

• Updated NOAA charts
• Provisions for facility removal



There are 7,235 acres acceptable for shellfish ranching having a maximum
depth of 150 feet and located in federal waters. The red outlined acreage
complies with USCG set back safety regulatory requirements from oil
platforms, pipelines and avoids crew boat transit routes.





Oil Platform Radius



100 acres amounts to 15/100ths of 1% of the area of Block 739. Comparing the 
takes from Block 739 to California’s total takes would equal 1/4 of 10/1,000 of 
1% for sardines, and 1 100/1,000  of 1% for squid. 



Reported Catches from Area



Shellfish farms in New Zealand serve as mid-water artificial reefs
providing a novel foraging/breeding habitat and a refuge from
predators that enhance recreational and sport fishing.



SUSTAINABLE SHELLFISH MARICULTURE

This venture will:

• Create jobs

• Put a dent in the $10      
billion national seafood 
deficit

• Create fisheries 
habitat

• Bolster a vibrant 
working waterfront in 
San Pedro
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HABITAT COMMITTEE REPORT ON OPEN PUBLIC COMMENT 

 
The Habitat Committee (HC) discussed the National Marine Fisheries Service 
(NMFS) report submitted under Open Public Comment (E.1.a, Supplemental 
NMFS Report) on an initiative to determine fisheries-specific habitat objectives, 
and presented by NMFS members on the HC. The initiative’s goal is to develop 
proposals for examining habitat objectives for commercially harvested stocks and 
for defining the process by which these objectives might be determined. The 
proposal is due to NMFS Office of Habitat Conservation in mid-May, therefore 
NMFS is seeking input from the Council on the goals and concept now.  
 
The HC enthusiastically supports the project goals and notes they are consistent 
with Council research and data needs. HC suggests that the Council send a letter of 
support for the proposal concept by the first week of May in order to improve its 
chances of funding. NMFS will keep the Council informed as the proposal moves 
forward.  
 
The initiative currently has limited funding, so the HC recommends any proposal 
consider well-studied stocks and leverage other existing habitat assessment efforts 
(e.g., Pacific Marine and Estuarine Fish Habitat Partnership habitat assessments). 
HC members noted the importance for considering impacts of climate change, and 
for utilizing datasets with sufficient power to detect habitat-specific signals useful 
for establishing objectives from spatiotemporal noise. HC members representing 
California Department of Fish and Wildlife and the Sanctuaries suggested their 
existing monitoring and datasets may help inform this proposal. 
 
 
PFMC 
04/05/14 
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PACIFIC FISHERY-SPECIFIC HABITAT CONSERVATION OBJECTIVES 

A PILOT EFFORT TO REBUILD AND MAINTAIN SUSTAINABLE FISHERIES 
THROUGH TARGETED HABITAT CONSERVATION 

 

NMFS is looking to strategically target its habitat conservation resources towards achieving 
measurable outcomes for managed fisheries. NMFS is seeking Council support to begin a pilot 
effort to identify habitat conservation objectives for managed species on the West Coast. 

NMFS and the Regional Fishery Management Councils (FMCs) have turned the corner on 
ending overfishing and are working to maximize the productivity and sustainability of fisheries 
and fishing communities. NMFS, RFMCs, and partners have made significant strides to establish 
annual catch limits, accountability measures, and rebuilding plans to achieve long-term 
productivity and sustainability of our nation’s fisheries. Despite progress, certain stocks appear 
to respond poorly and/or belatedly to rebuilding measures. The health of some of these stocks 
may be linked to their dependence on particular habitats during critical lifestages. NMFS is 
increasing its efforts to strategically align and integrate habitat conservation efforts to rebuild 
these stocks and to support the needs of other federally-managed fish stocks. 

Protecting and restoring habitat will help NMFS, FMCs, states, and partners achieve their 
sustainable fisheries goals. However, we must be more explicit in the identification of those 
habitats where we can achieve measurable benefits that will support priority, habitat-dependent 
fish stocks. To this end, NMFS’s Office of Habitat Conservation has up to $100K to support one 
or two pilot projects to establish these fishery-specific habitat objectives. 

NMFS is developing a proposal for a West Coast pilot project. While still in development, the 
project is likely to: 

1. Identify 2-5 focal species of habitat-dependent fishes. It is expected that these species 
will include both groundfishes and salmon. 

2. Develop fishery-specific habitat conservation objectives for each species, and 
3. Develop a plan for NMFS to target existing habitat conservation efforts to meet these 

objectives, including necessary management, monitoring, and evaluation needs. 

Outcomes of this work can inform future Council EFH reviews and initiatives under its Fishery 
Management and Ecosystem Plans, and inform future research and data needs documents. 
Demonstrated success and/or lessons learned could be applied to other projects, regions, and 
councils. Council support for this effort is an essential ingredient for a successful pilot project. 
We hope we can count on that support, and will provide an update on specifics of the project 
proposal and its status at a future Council meeting. 


	E1_OC1_TIRN_DriftGillnets_APR2014BB
	E1_SUP_OC2_ThreeLetters_APR2014BB
	E1_SUP_OC3_CatalinaSeaRanch_APR2014BB
	Slide Number 1
	Slide Number 2
	Slide Number 3
	Slide Number 4
	Adopted Mitigation and Monitoring Plan
	Slide Number 6
	Slide Number 7
	Oil Platform Radius
	Slide Number 9
	Reported Catches from Area
	Slide Number 11
	Slide Number 12

	E1a_SUP_HC_Rpt_APR2014BB
	E1a_SUP_NMFS_Rpt_HabConsv_APR2014BB



